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February 20,200l

BY HAND DELIVERY /:‘I;

Federal Communications C mmission
1270 Fairfield Road

i;;’ ,.

P

g
Gettysburg, Pennsylvania 1 325-7245 IT-

i-.

RE: Northcoast Communications, L.L.C. I
\,

FCC Form 402 - Ownership Disclosure Informatioh

Dear Sir or Madam:

Submitted for filing
one original of a completed

n behalf of Northcoast Communications. L.L.C. (“Northcoast”) is
CC Form 602. containing updated own rship information for

Northcoast. This updated fo
with Northcoast’s pending

c

is being filed at the request of Commi sion staff. in conjunction

i

orm 601. seeking authorization to operat 11 C and F block
broadband PCS licenses for hich  Northcoast was the high bidder in uction  No. 35.

There is no filing fee associated with this form. Please date-s amp the attached copy of
this filing, and return in the attached postage-paid envelope. If you h
this filing, please contact thd undersigned counsel. t

ve any questions regarding

Sincerely,.

cc: John M. Dolan
Erin McGrath

134978*



FCC 602
Main Form

F&O -wnership Disdosure  Information foi the
Wireless Telecommunications Services

1) First Name (if Individual): MI. Last Name:

2) Applicant Name (if entity):

Northcoast Communications, L.L.C.

Related FCC Regulated Businesses of ApplicanffLicensee

48) 4b)
Name and address of all FCC Regulated Businesses Pnnupal Busmess
owned by ApplicanffLKwwee (use additIonal  s

necessary).

See Exhibit A

Signature

Approved by Oh4B

3060 - 0799
See instrudlons  for
public burden esttmate

4C)
TIN

W
Percent of

Interest Held

First Name: suffix:

John

Title.
President and CEO

WILLFUL FALSE STATEMENTS MADE ON MIS FORM  OR ANY AlTACHMENTS  ARE PUNlS’hABLE  BY FINE AND/Ok IMPRISONMENT (U.S. Code, Title 18.
Section 1001) AND/OR  REVOCAllON  OF ANY STATION LICENSE OR CONSTRUCTlON  PERMIT (U.S. Code, Title 47, Section 312(a)(l)),  AND/OR FORFEITURE
(U.S. Code, Title 47, Section 503).

FCC 602
February 1999 - Page I



FCC 602
’ Schedule A

FCC Ownershlg Disclosure Information for the
Wreless  Telecommunications Services

Schedule for Disclosable Interest Holders

Approved by OMB
3060-0799
See mstrucbons  for
publtc  burden estimate

Disclosable Interest Holder Information (cbmplete  as many as required to describe all digclosable  interest holders)
1) Disclosable Interest Holder’s First Name (if individual): MI: Last Name: SUffiX

2) Disclosable Interest Holder’s Name (if entity):

Northcoast PCS, L.L.C.

3) Disclosable Interest Holder’s TIN:

-----Hp.

4) Disclosable Interest Holder’s Address

i80 Baylis Road, Suite 2Ob
5) Type of Interest in Applicant ( ) 6) Drsclosable Interest Holder is a(n): ( ) 7) Percent of Interest Held in Appkant:

(refer to Instructions for list) (refer to instructions for kit of codes):

I
D
8) Drsclosable Interest Holder’s Type of Ownership. 50*1%9) Disclosable Interest Holder’s Country of Citizenship:

(refer to instructions for lrst):

, Melville, New York 11743

L

1
O- Membership Interest USA - Delawd're LLC
0) Relationship Description (if the discloseable interest holder is an indirect owner, list path of ownership frc+n indirect owner to the applicant)

DNA II

Related FCC Regulated Businesses of Disclosable Interest Holders lreoeat  for each interest holder identified). .
lla)

Name and address of all FCC Regulated Businesses
owned by D,isclosable Interest Holder listed in #3 (use

additional sheets, if necessary):
I

See Exhibit A

l l b )
Pnncipal  Busrness.

llc)
TIN:

lid)
Percent of

Interest Held



FCC 602 FCC Ownership Disclosure Information for the
* Schedule A Wireless Telecommunications Services

Approved by OMB
3060 - 0799
See insb-ucbons  for

Schedule for Disclosable Interest Holders pubhc  burden estrmate

Iisclosable  Interest Holder Information (complete as many as required to describe all di@losable  interest holders)
1) Disclosable Interest Holder’s First Name (if individual): MI: Last Name: SUffl.

2) Disclosable Interest Holder’s Name (if enbty): le Interest Holder’s TIN

--‘dY<-.
Cablevision PCS Investment, Inc.
4) Disclosable Interest Holder’s Address

1111 Stewart Avenue,Bethpage, New York 11714
5) Type of Interest in Applicant ( ) 6) Drsclosable  Interest Holder IS a(n): ( ) 7) Percent of Interest Held in Applicant:

(refer to Instructions for list) (refer to mstructions  for list of codes)

D L
8) Disclosable Interest Holder’s Type of Ownership

(refer to instructions for list):

C 49.9%
9) Disclosable Interest Holder’s Country of Citizenship:

0 - Membership Interest I USA - Delaware Corp.
10) Relationship Description (if the discloseable interest holder IS an rndrrect  owner, list path of ownership fr ,m indirect owner to the applicant):

DNA III

Related FCC Regulated Businesses of Disclosable Interest Holders (repeat for each interest holder identified)

l l a ) l l b ) 1l’C)
Name and address of all FCC Regulated Businesses Principal Business: TIN:
owned by Disclosable Interest Holder listed in #3 (use

additional sheets, if necessary):

See Exhibit A

l l d )
Percent of

Interest Held.

,
/
I

1



FCC 602 FCC Ownership Disc!osure Information for 6 Approved by OMB

* Schedule A Wireless Telecommunications Services 3060 - 0799
See mtrucbons  for

Schedule for Disclosable Interest Holders public burden estimate

Disclosable Interest Holder Information (complete as many as required to describe all disclosable interest holders)
1) Disclosable Interest Holder’s First Name (ii individual): MI: Last Name

II

2) Disclosable Interest Holder’s Name (if entity):

I
3) Disclosable Interest Holder’s TIN

I

Antares, Inc.
4) Disclosable Interest Holder’s Address,

80 Baylis Road,
5) Type of Interest in Applicant (

(refer to Instructions for list)

I
8) DIsclosable  Interest Holder’s Type of Ownership

(refer to instructions for list):

New York 11747
) 7) Percent of Interest Held in Applicant:

ll------ i
1 79%

9) DIsclosable  Interest Holder’s Country of Cltlzenshtp:

0 - Membership Interest I USA - Delaware Corp.
IO) Relationship Description (if the discloseable interest holder is an indirect owner, list path of ownership from indirect Owner to the applicant):

Antares holds a 79% intejrest in Northcoast PCS, LLC, which in turn holds a
50.1% interest in the Filer. ;!

L

[elated  FCC Regulated Businesses of Disclosable Interest Holders (repeat for each interest holder identified)

l l a )
Name and address of all FCC Regulated Businesses
owned by Disclosable Interest Holder listed in 43 (use

additional sheets, if necessary):

lib)
Principal Business:

l l c )
TIN:

l l d )
Percent of

Interest Held:

See Exhibit A



FCC 602
’ Schedule  A

FCC Ownership Disclosure Information for tie’
Wireless Telecommunications Services

Approved by OMB
3060 - 0799
.See instrucbons for

Schedule for Disclosable Interest Holders pubk burden estrmate

Disclosable Interest Holder Information (complete as many as required to describe all disclosable interest holders)
1) Disclosable Interest Holder’s First Name (if individual): Ml: Last Name: suffix

2) Disclosable Interest Holder’s Name (if entity):

Antares II, Inc.
4) Disclosable Interest Holder’s Address:

80 Baylis Road, Suite ZOP, Melville, New York 11741
5) Type of Interest in Applicant ( ) 6) Disclosable Interest Holder is a(n): ( ) 7) Percent of Interest Held in Applrcant.

(refer to Instructions for list)

I

(refer to rnstruchons  for kit of codes):

I '(c
8) Disclosable Interest Holder’s Type of Ownership

(refer to instructions for list):
9) Disclosable Interest Holder’s Country of Citizenship:

0 - Membership Interest 1 USA - Delawdre Corp.
IO) Relationship Descripbon  (if the discloseable interest holder IS an tndrrect owner, list path of ownership frdn indrrect  owner to the applrcant):

Antares II holds a 21% interest in Northcoast PCS, LLC, which in turn holds
50.1% interest in the Filer. I

Related FCC Regulated Businesses of Disclosable Interest Holders (repeat for each int/erest holder identified)

lla) l l b )
Name and address of all FCC Regulated Businesses

l l c )
Prrncrpal  Busmess

l l d )
TIN.

owned by Disclosable Interest Holder listed in #3 (use
1 Percent of

additional sheets, if necessary):
1 ‘Interest Held

See Exhibit i



FCC 602
Schedule A

FCC Ownership Disclosure Information for&
Wireless Telecommunications Sewices

Schedule for Disclosable Interest Holders

Approved by OMB
3060 - 0799
See instructions for
public  burden estimate

Disclosable Interest Holder Information (complete as many as required to desciibe  all disclosable interest holders)

1) Disclosable Interest Holder’s Pint Name (if individual): MI: Last Name: SLlffiix

1

1
Related FCC Reaulated Businesses of Disclosable Interest Holders lreoeat  for each interest holder identified)

John
2) Disclosable Interest Holder’s Name (if entity):

4) Disclosable Interest Holder’s Address:

M Dolan I
3) Disclosable Interest Holder’s TIN:
__.

2 - -

80 Baylis Road, Suite 201, Melville, New York 1174!7
5) Type of Interest in Applicant ( ) 6) Disclosable Interest Holder is a(n): ( ) 7) Percent of Interest Held in Applicant:

(refer to Instructions for list) (refer to instructions for list of codes):

I

I,O,R,K - I 100%
8) Disclosable Interest Holder’s Type of Ownership 9) Drsclosable  Interest Holder’s Country of Crtrzenship:

(refer to instrucbons  for list):

0 - Votinq Membership Ioterest US Citizen
0) Relationship Description (if the discloseable interest holder is an indrrect owner, list path of ownership from indrrect owner to the applicant):

John M. Dolan owns 100% of Antares, Inc., and 4% 04 Antares II, Inc. These
companies jointly own a 100% interest in Northcoas PCS, LLC, which in turn
holds a 50.1% controlling interest in the Filer.

, .

.__.-_--.  - _ .._..,- .._ -.. -.

lla)
Name and address of all FCC Regulated Businesses
owned by Disclosable Interest Holder listed in #3 (use

additional sheets, if necessary):

See Exhibit A

. .
llb)

Principal Business:
llc)
TIN:

l l d )
Percent of

Interest Held:

I

!



FCC 602 FCC Ownership Disclosure Information for the Approved by OMB

Schedule A Wireless ielecommunications Services 3 0 6 0  - 0 7 9 9

See instructions for

Schedule for Disclosable Interest Holders pubk burden estimate

Disclosable Interest Holder Information (complete as many as required to describe all disclosable interest holders)
MI: Last Name:

II
1) Disclosable Interest Holder’s First Name (if individual): Suffix:

2) Disclosable Interest Holder’s Name (if entity):
I
ILL--3 DIsclosable  Interest Holder’s TIN._~

1

CSC Holdings, Inc.
4) Disclosable Interest Holder’s Address:

c

1111 Stewart Avenue, Bethpage, New York 11714
5) Type of Interest in Applicant ( ) 6) Disclosable Interest Holder is a(n): ( ) 7) Percent of Interest Held in Applicant:

(refer to Instructions for list) (refer to instructions for list of codes):

I 1 c I 49.9%
6) Drsclosable  Interest Holder’s Type of Ownership 9) Disclosable Interest Holder’s Country of Crtlzenshrp:

(refer to instructions for list):

II

0 - Membership Interest USA - Delaware Corp.
0) Relationship Description (if the discloseable Interest holder IS an indrrect owner, lrst path of ownership frglm indirect owner to the applrcant):

CSC Holdings holds 100% of the voting stock of Cablevision PCS Investment,
Inc., which in turn holds a 49.9% LLC membership irjlterest in the Filer.

II ,

Related FCC Regulated Businesses of Disclosable Interest Holders (repeat for each interest holder identified)

l l a )
Name and address of all FCC Regulated Businesses
owned by Disclosable Interest Holder listed in #3 (use

additional sheets, if necessary):

See Exhibit A



FCC 602 FCC Ownership Disc:losure  Information for the

SchedtJe  A Wireless Telecommunications Services
Approved by OMB
3060-0799
See m.trucbons  for
pubk burden estimate

Schedule for Disc’losable Interest Holders

Iisclosable Interest Holder Information (complete as many as required to describe all disclosable interest holders)
1) Disclosable Interest Holder’s First Name (if individual): MI: Last Name:

II

Ill

Ill

2) Disclosable Interest Holder’s Name (if entii):

SUffl

AT&T Corporation
4) Disclosable Interest Holder’s Address:

265 North Maple Avenue, Basking Ridge, New Jersey 07920
5) Type of Interest in Applicant ( ) 6) Disclosable Interest Holder is a(n): ( ) 7) Percent of Interest Held in Applicant:

(refer to Instructions for list) (refer to instructions for list of codes):

I IC I 1 4 . 4 %

8) Disclosable Interest Holder’s Type of Ownership 9) DIsclosable  Interest Holder’s Country of Cttuenship:
(refer to instructions for bst):

O- Ownership Interest in CSC 1 USA 111
IO) Relationship Description (if the discloseable interest holder IS an tndrrect owner, list path of ownershrp  frem indirect owner to the applrcant):

AT&T holds a 29% interest in CSC Holdings, which owns 100% of Cablevision
PCS Investment, Inc., which in turn owns 49.9% of 4he Filer.

I , .

Related FCC Reaulated Businesses of Disclosable Interest Holders (repeat for each interest holder identified)

l l a )
Name and address of all FCC Regulated Businesses
owned by Disclosable Interest Holder listed in #3 (use

additional sheets, a necessary):

See Exhibit A

l l b )
Principal Business:

1lC)
TIN:

l l d )
Percent of

Interest Held.



FCC 602
Schedlrle  A

FCC Ownership Disclosure Information for the
Wireless Telecommunications Services

Approti  by Oh@
3060 - 0709
See msbucbont  for

Schedule for Disclosable Interest Holders pubk burden estmate

Xsclosable  Interest Holder Information (complete as many as required to describe all disclosable interest holders)
1) Disclosable Interest Holder’s First  Name (if indrvidual) MI: Last Name. suffw.

Stephen
2) Disclosable interest Holder’s Name (if entity):

IM 1 Curtin
I3J Disclosable Interest-Hger’s  TIN:

4) Disclosable interest Holder’s Address:

80 Baylis Road, Suite 203 , Melville, New York 11747
5) Type of Interest in Applicant ( )

(refer to Instructions for list)

R

8) DIsclosable  Interest Holder’s Type of Ownership
(refer to instructrons for list):

6) Disclosable Interest Holder IS a(n): ( ) 7) Percent of Interest Held n Appleant:
(refer to ~nstructlons  for list of codes)

I 0%
9) DIsclosable  Interest Holder’s Country of Cltuenship:

0 - No Ownership Interest - Bd Member 1 US Citizen
10) Relationship Description (if the discloseable interest holder is an indirect owner, list path of ownership f&n indirect owner to the applicant):

Mr. Curtin is a member of the Management Committee of th& Filer.

Related FCC Regulated Businesses of Disclosable Interest Holders (repeat for each interest holder identified)

lla) lib) llc)
Name and address of all FCC Regulated Businesses Pnnclpal  Business

1

TIN:
owned by DIsclosable  Interest Holder listed in #3 (use

addltional  sheets, if necessary):

IIINone
I/
I

l l d )
Percent of

Interest Held



FCC 602
Schedule A

FCC Ownership Disclosure Information for the
Wireless Telecommunications Services

Schedule for Disclosable Interest Holders

Approved by OMB
3 0 6 0  - 0 7 9 9
See instructions for
pubk burden estimate

Disclosable Interest Holder Information (complete as many as required to describe all disclosable interest holders)
1) Disclosable Interest Holder’s First Name (if individual): MI: Last Name: Ill sufflx

4) Disclosable Interest Holder’s Address:

80 Baylis Road, Suite 201, Melville, New York 117417
5) Type of Interest in Applicant ( ) 6) Disclosable Interest Holder is a(n): ( ) ,,, 7) Percent of Interest Held in Applicant:

(refer to Instructions for list) (refer to instructions for list of codes):

Ii

R I 0%
8) Disclosable Interest Holder’s Type of Ownership 9) Disclosable Interest Holder’s Country of Citizenship:

(refer to instructions for list):

1

O- No Ownership Interest - Bd Member US Citizen
,O) Relationship Description (if the discloseable interest holder is an indirect owner, list path of ownership from indirect owner to the applicant):

Ms. Dolce is a member of the Management Committee of the Filer.

Related FCC Regulated Businesses of Disclosable Interest Holders (repeat for each interest holder identified), I I /,
l l a )

Name and address of all FCC Regulated Businesses
owned by Disclosable Interest Holder listed in #3 (use -

additional sheets, if necessary):

l l b )
Pnncipal  Business:

l l c )
TIN:

l l d )
IiPercent of ,

Interest Held

I
I



Direct Ownership,

NORTHCOAST COMMUNICATIONS, L.L.C.
FCC FORM 602

EXHIBIT A
Page 1 of 2

Northcoast Communications, L.L.C.(“Northcoast”) is a Delaware L L.C., which has the
following two direct owners: I

A. Northcoast PCS, L.L.C. (“Northcoast PCS”)
80 Baylis Road
Suite 201
Melville, New York 11747
Citizenship: Delaware Limited Liability Company

B. Cablevision PCS Investment, Inc. (“Cablevision PC
1111 Stewart Avenue
Bethpage, New York 117 14
Citizenship: Delaware Corporation

Northcoast presently holds 49 D, E and F block broadband PCS
other FCC licenses, nor does it hold an ownership or controlling int

It does not hold any

regulated by the FCC. Neither Northcoast PCS or Cablevision
est in any other entity

controlling interest in any entity regulated by the FCC, other
old an ownership or

Indirect Ownership

The following four entities hold indirect ownership interests in Northcoast:

A. Antares, Inc.
80 Baylis Road
Suite 201
Melville, New York 11747

B. Antares II, Inc.
80 Baylis Road
Suite 201
Melville, New York 11747

C CSC Holdings, Inc.
1111 Stewart Avenue
Bethpage, New York 117 14

D. AT&T Corporation
265 North Maple Avenue
Basking Ridge, New Jersey 07920

134526-



NORTHCOAST COMMUNICATIONS, L.L.C.
FCC FORM 602

EXHIBIT A
Page 2 of 2

The following summarizes the FCC Regulated Interests of the foregoing Disclosable Interest
Holders:

A. Antares does not directly hold any FCC licenses, nor does it have any pending
applications for licenses. Further, Antares does not hold an attributable interest
in any entity that holds any FCC licenses or applications.

B. Antares II does not directly hold any FCC licenses, nor does it have any pending
applications for licenses. Further, Antares II does not hold an attributable interest
in any entity that holds any FCC licenses or applications.

C.

D.

CSC is a diversified media and communications company, which through its
numerous subsidiaries and operating companies holds, FCC licenses and is
otherwise generally subject to FCC regulation. i

,
AT&T is a diversified telecommunications company, which through its numerous
subsidiaries, affiliates and operating companies holds numerous FCC licenses and
applications.

Finally, other than John M. Dolan’s interests reported directly in the Form 602, none of
Northcoast’s other controlling interest holders (i.e., officers or direct&s) directly hold any FCC
licenses or applicaiions,  or hold an attributable interest in an entity that holds FCC licenses or
applications.

134526-I


